
Waste Reduction/Recycling and Energy Grants  

   

Boston Mountain Solid Waste District’s Mini-grant   

Deadline: November 2020   

https://www.bostonmountain.org/grants 
This grant is available to schools, civic organizations, and nonprofits addressing waste reduction and 
diversion, so it is a great opportunity for purchasing recycling receptacles, compost bins/materials, 
educational materials and other items. Grants are available for up to $500. Applying organizations must 
reside in Washington or Madison County. Please email recycle@bmswd.com for more information.   
   

ClimateChangeLIVE Grants for School Projects   

Deadline: TBD   

https://www.plt.org/apply-for-greenworks-environmental-education-grant   
Project Learning Tree offers GreenWorks! grants up to $1,000 to schools and youth organizations for 
environmental service-learning projects that link classroom learning to the real world. Students 
implement an action project they help design to green their school or to improve an aspect of their 
neighborhood’s environment. To be eligible, applicants must have attended a PLT workshop, either in-
person or online, that provides training, lesson plans, and other resources to help integrate these 

projects and environmental education into your curriculum or youth programs.   
   
Coca-Cola / Keep America Beautiful Recycling Bin Grant 

Deadline: December 31, 2020 

https://kab.org/grants/coca-cola/ 
The Coca-Cola / Keep America Beautiful Recycling Bin Grant Program supports local community recycling 
initiatives by providing selected grant recipients with receptacles for the collection of beverage 
container recyclables in public settings. Grant recipients will receive actual recycling bins instead of 
funding. For the Public Space bin grant program, the grant program is open to non-profit organizations, 

government agencies, schools and religious organizations.   
   

FundingFactory  

Deadline: Ongoing   

http://www.fundingfactory.com/   
FundingFactory turns your used toner and inkjet cartridges into cash to fund your organization. With 
FundingFactory's 100% free fundraising program and the help of your community, your organization will 

earn much-needed funds in no time.   
   

KAB Youth Poster Contest  

Deadline: February 29, 2020   

http://keeparkansasbeautiful.com/for-kids/youth-poster-contest/   
Keep America Beautiful (KAB) coordinates a Youth Poster Contest in conjunction with the Great 
American Cleanup in Arkansas to involve elementary school students, increase awareness of the Great 
American Cleanup in Arkansas, and educate the public about the importance of a clean and beautiful 
community to economic development, civic pride and environmental quality of life. Prizes will be 
awarded in two divisions: Grades K - 2 and Grades 3 - 5. KAB is providing gift cards for the top 3 posters 
in each division. One poster per class may be submitted for statewide judging. 4-H clubs, scout groups 
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and home-schooled students are also encouraged to enter. Winning posters and honorable mentions 
will be displayed May 12-30 in Thea Foundation's art gallery on Main Street in North Little Rock. Posters 

will also be posted to KAB's Facebook page.   
   

National Green Cup Challenge   

Deadline: Ongoing   

https://www.greenschoolsalliance.org/tools/challenges/greencup   

Created by schools for schools, the Green Cup Challenge™ is a month long, inter-school competition that 
empowers students and builds community, while raising awareness about climate change and the 

importance of resource conservation.   
   

Office Depot Recycling Rules   

Deadline: Ongoing   

http://www.myschoolrecycles.com/home.aspx   
Office Depot program to promote recycling of ink and toner cartridges in schools. K through 12 schools 
that participate will receive a gift card from Office Depot for the value amount of the recycled 

cartridges. Any school can participate for free, and boxes are provided.   
   

Target Field Trip Grants   

Deadline: TBD 

https://corporate.target.com/corporate-responsibility/grants/field-trip-grants   
Good news—registration’s open for the Target Field Trip Grants program. We’ll be awarding 5,000 
grants of $700 each to schools for the upcoming school year. Teachers can use a grant to fund a school 
field trip that connects their curriculum to out-of-school experiences. It’s a great way to engage and 

inspire students, and could be used to visit local recycling and landfill facilities.   
   

Zayed Future Energy Prize   

Deadline: June 11, 2020   

http://www.zayedfutureenergyprize.com   
The Zayed Future Energy Prize represents the vision of the Late Founding Father and President of the 
United Arab Emirates, Sheikh Zayed bin Sultan al Nahyan, who championed environmental stewardship. 
This annual award celebrates achievements that reflect impact, innovation, long-term vision and 
leadership in renewable energy and sustainability. We invite you to be a part of this vision and our 
commitment to finding solutions that will meet the challenges of climate change, energy security and 

the environment.   
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